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To:  Alaska Public Offices Commission 

From:  Alaska Public Interest Research Group and 907 Initiative 

 
Re:  Supporting Information and Documentation for APOC Complaint Against Brett Huber, 

Strategic Synergies, LLC, the Republican Governor’s Association, A Stronger Alaska, 

Dunleavy for Governor, and Michael J. Dunleavy. 

 
Respondents:1 
 

Republican Governors Association 
1747 Pennsylvania Avenue NW, Suite 250 

Washington, DC 20006 

Telephone: 202-662-4140 

info@rga.org 

Erim Canligil, CFO 

ecanligil@rga.org  

Stacey Stone (counsel to RGA) 

sstone@hwb-law.com 

 

A Stronger Alaska 
1747 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW, Suite 250 

Washington, DC 20006 

Telephone: 202-662-4928 

Erim Canligil, Treasurer 

ecanligil@rga.org  

Stacey Stone (counsel to ASA) 

sstone@hwb-law.com    

 

Brett Huber Sr. 
Sole owner of Strategic Synergies, LLC 

2617 Shepherdia Drive  

Anchorage, AK 99503 

Telephone: 907-312-6600 

bretthuber62@gmail.com  

 

Strategic Synergies, LLC 
United States Corporation Agents, Inc. 

Registered Agent for Strategic Synergies, LLC 

721 Depot Drive 

Anchorage, AK 99501 

 

Dunleavy for Governor   
John Sturgeon, Chair 

4450 Shoshoni Avenue 

Anchorage, AK 99516 

907-290-7682 

info@dunleavygovernor.com  

Kevin F. Fimon, Treasurer 

4860 Shelikof Street 

Anchorage, AK 99507 

907-306-6604 

ffskevin@gmail.com  

 

Michael J. Dunleavy, Candidate for Governor 
PO Box 190251 

Anchorage, AK 99519 

907-290-7682 

info@dunleavygovernor.com  

 

 

 
1  This information is intended to satisfy the required contact information for this APOC 

Complaint.  It has also been relied upon for service of the complaint, with additional 

documentation to follow.  Additional information about the Respondents is included below. 
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I. INTRODUCTION 

 Through the use of common consultants and staff members, the Republican Governors 

Association (“RGA”) and current Governor and gubernatorial candidate Michael J. Dunleavy 

(“Dunleavy”) are engaged in a scheme to subsidize and coordinate the campaign activities of the 

multi-million-dollar SuperPAC — A Stronger Alaska (“ASA”) — with those of Dunleavy’s 

official campaign committee, Dunleavy for Governor (“DFG”).  Because coordination between a 

candidate — or even a candidate’s representatives — and a SuperPAC is prohibited, the Alaska 

Public Offices Commission (“APOC” or “the Commission”) must act immediately to restrain 

unlawfully-coordinated campaign communications.   

Typically, the Commission issues per-day fines to individuals and entities who fail to 

comply with their disclosure laws.  However, disclosure is not, in and of itself, the issue in this 

instance.  Rather, activities are occurring, and are anticipated to continue to occur, that are in 

blatant violation of the entire legal scheme regulating independent expenditures (“IEs”) under both 

State and Federal law, and no fine structure can retroactively cure that illegality.   

Accordingly, the Commission must act swiftly to enjoin ASA from acting to impact the 

2022 gubernatorial campaign until APOC Staff can fully investigate the scope of the Respondents’ 

illegal activities, and/or the Commission must order the entity dissolved and require that all 

donations be refunded.2   

 
2  See AS 15.13.380(c) (“In deciding whether to expedite consideration, the commission shall 

consider such factors as [(1)] whether the alleged violation, if not immediately restrained, could 

materially affect the outcome of an election or other impending event; [(2)] whether the alleged 

violation could cause irreparable harm that penalties could not adequately remedy; and 

[(3)] whether there is reasonable cause to believe that a violation has occurred or will occur. . . .  

[T]he commission may independently expedite consideration of the complaint if the commission 

finds that the standards for expedited consideration set out in this subsection have been met.”). 
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II. THE PARTIES 

In summary, the parties/Respondents to this Complaint are as follows: 

 The Republican Governors Association:  The RGA is an IRS Section 527 tax-exempt entity 

whose purpose is to elect and re-elect Republican Governors.  The RGA aggregates vast sums of 

money and then supports Republican gubernatorial candidates, typically through donations to IEs 

or “SuperPACs.”  The RGA is a well-known “Dark Money” organization that compiles vast sums 

anonymously and then deploys those funds in elections without disclosing its true donors.3  The 

RGA has raised hundreds of millions of dollars to support its preferred candidates and, as discussed 

below, intends to spend millions in the 2022 gubernatorial campaign to support Dunleavy. 

 A Stronger Alaska:  ASA is a SuperPAC apparently created for the sole purpose of 

supporting Dunleavy’s re-election.   It was formed on February 24, 2021, and has received only a 

single donation — $3 million — which was made from the RGA the day following ASA’s 

formation.  ASA appears to be a mere instrumentality for the RGA acting in Alaska because, in 

addition to being solely funded by the RGA, its registered Treasurer is Erim Canligil, who is the 

Chief Financial Officer for the RGA,4 and its registered Chair is Dave Rexrode, who is the 

Executive Director of the RGA.5  Accordingly, whatever wrongdoing ASA is ultimately found to 

have engaged in must also be imputed to the RGA. 

 Brett Huber Sr. & Strategic Synergies, LLC:  Brett Huber Sr. (“Huber”) is a former 

Dunleavy staffer and political operative who has worked for Dunleavy in some capacity since as 

early as 2014, when Dunleavy was a state senator.  Strategic Synergies, LLC (“SS”) is solely 

 
3  See, e.g., https://www.cleveland.com/news/2022/04/dark-money-group-helping-gov-

mike-dewine-was-funded-by-republican-governors-association-pac.html. 
4  See https://www.rga.org/rga-announces-senior-staff-2/. 

5  See https://www.linkedin.com/in/david-rexrode-1118594/. 
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owned by Huber and only offers his political consulting services.6  ASA contracted with Huber 

and SS on April 29, 2022 to run its campaign activities in support of Dunleavy in the 2022 Primary 

Election (and presumably the General Election as well).7  

Governor/candidate Michael J. Dunleavy: Dunleavy is the current governor of the State of 

Alaska.  He was elected in 2018 and is a registered candidate running for re-election in 2022.  

Dunleavy has previously been fined for improperly using public funds for partisan political 

advertisements.8  Dunleavy has a number of current and former campaign staff who are also the 

recipients of public funds through contracts for dubious purposes in apparent attempts to subsidize 

their work on his campaign for re-election.   

 Dunleavy for Governor:  DFG is the official campaign entity for Dunleavy’s re-election 

campaign.  The campaign manager for DFG is Jordan Shilling.9  Shilling is a former staffer for 

Dunleavy and is currently the recipient of a no-bid contract with the governor’s office that pays 

him $10,000 per month in public funds to provide “strategic planning” about renewable energy.10  

While performing this publicly-financed contract, he claims to be running Dunleavy’s statewide 

re-election campaign for no pay, as a “volunteer.”11 

 
6  Exhibit A. 

7  Exhibit B. 

8  https://alaskapublic.org/2020/09/07/alaska-gov-dunleavy-will-pay-2800-to-settle-ethics-

complaints-over-publicly-funded-ad-campaign/. 

9  https://www.adn.com/politics/2022/05/31/gov-dunleavys-office-signs-contract-with-

former-aide-whos-also-being-paid-to-help-with-his-re-election/. 

10  Exhibit C. 

11  https://www.adn.com/politics/2022/05/31/gov-dunleavys-office-signs-contract-with-

former-aide-whos-also-being-paid-to-help-with-his-re-election/. 



 5 

III. FACTUAL BACKGROUND 

A. Dunleavy’s Scheme To Improperly Subsidize His Campaign With 
Public Resources. 

Through July 15 of this year, DFG has reported virtually no payments for campaign staff 

— they have paid a grand total of $6,200 for staff, with $5,000 of that going to a single staffer, 

Cassandra Day.12  This amount would be low for a state legislative race; in a statewide governor’s 

race, for the incumbent, it is laughable.13   

Upon further inspection, the reason for this low reported spending is clear:  During this 

same time period, Governor Dunleavy has directed his office to retain senior campaign operatives 

on substantial contracts paid for with public funds.  Governor Dunleavy has repeatedly engaged in 

this practice of using his office to send public money, jobs, and contracts to political operatives 

who are simultaneously working on his re-election campaign as “volunteers.”  In this way, he is 

improperly utilizing public funds to subsidize his re-election campaign.   

Jordan Shilling:  Jordan Shilling is a longtime legislative staffer in the Alaska Capitol, best 

known for his work on SB91, a criminal justice reform bill, in 2016.  Shilling repeatedly testified 

in favor of SB91 and is one of the individuals most credited with shepherding the bill through to 

passage.14  Shilling then worked for Governor Dunleavy from December 2018 until spring of this 

year.  After leaving the governor’s office, Shilling became the campaign manager for DFG and is 

doing that work on an “unpaid volunteer” basis.  Curiously (and not coincidentally), simultaneous 

 
12  https://aws.state.ak.us/ApocReports/Common/View.aspx?ID=37395&ViewType=CD. 

13  For example, two of Dunleavy’s opponents who have raised similar amounts of money 

have spent approximately $180,000 (Walker-Drygas) and over $50,000 (Gara-Cook) for staff 

during the same time period. 

14  See Exhibit D; https://www.akleg.gov/basis/Meeting/Detail/?Meeting=SSTA%202016-

02-25%2009:00:00&Bill=SB%20%2091. 
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with his departure from state service, Shilling was awarded a no-bid contract with the governor’s 

office which pays him $10,000 per month to consult regarding “renewable energy” and “Division 

of Motor Vehicles policies.”15  This contract is performed directly under the supervision of the 

governor’s office, reporting directly to the Governor’s Chief of Staff, Tyson Gallagher 

(“Gallagher”).  Even more suspicious is the fact that the contract essentially runs for the duration 

of the gubernatorial campaign. 

Brett Huber: Huber has been in the employ of Michael J. Dunleavy in various capacities 

since 2014 when he worked as staff for the then-state senator.  Huber worked as Dunleavy’s 

campaign manager (for at least portions of the campaign) in the race for governor in 

2018.  Following that successful campaign, Huber was hired to work in the governor’s office as 

Communications Director.  In August of 2020, Governor Dunleavy’s office announced Huber’s 

departure, who explained to the Anchorage Daily News at the time that he was stepping away from 

state work in order to participate in campaign work.  In that article, the Anchorage Daily News 

noted that state law barred campaign work during official hours, and this prohibition drove Huber’s 

decision to operate as a “free agent.” 

Through November 2020, Huber worked as campaign manager for the unsuccessful 

campaign against Ballot Measure 2, the initiative that created the new election and campaign 

disclosure system in Alaska.  During an APOC proceeding — after which the Commission found 

that Huber’s group filed “wildly” “inaccurate” disclosures regarding its three largest contributors16 

— Huber testified, under oath, that he was an “unpaid volunteer” for the No on 2 campaign.  This 

 
15  Exhibit C. 

16  See Emergency Order, Yes on 2 for Better Elections v. Defend Alaska Elections – Vote No 
on 2, APOC Case No. 20-06-CD, at 6 (Oct. 8, 2020). 
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sworn testimony turned out to be demonstrably false; No on 2 reported paying Huber (through SS) 

$45,000 for his two months of work, just weeks later on November 14, 2020.17 

In July 2021, Governor Dunleavy re-hired Huber to work in a newly-created position as a 

“Senior Policy Advisor for Statehood Defense.”  Huber again left state employment on April 2, 

2022, amid public rumors that he would soon run the IE group in support of Dunleavy’s re-election.  

However, when Huber left, Dunleavy still found a way to pay him; Huber was awarded a no-bid 

contract for $8,333 per month through the election.18  Like Shilling’s contract, Huber’s agreement 

has him reporting directly to Gallagher, the Governor’s Chief of Staff.  Although Huber does not 

have a law degree, his contract calls for him to “research[] federal laws and regulations related to 

Alaska lands” and “provid[e] recommendations for legal action to protect Alaska.”19  These tasks 

would appear to be better and more appropriately covered by the hundreds of experienced and 

licensed attorneys working in the Department of Law. 

Both contracts pay these political operatives tens of thousands of dollars in public funds 

for work they appear unqualified to perform and/or work that should be more properly performed 

by state employees.  Not coincidentally, the contracts have essentially zero deliverables and their 

duration corresponds almost identically with Governor Dunleavy’s campaign for re-election. 

 
17  Paid to “Strategic Synergies, LLC, 

https://aws.state.ak.us/ApocReports/Common/View.aspx?ID=33618&ViewType=CD.  While 

investigating this Complaint the Commission and APOC Staff must take Huber’s prior lack of 

candor and proclivity to evade the truth into account if and when he provides discovery responses 

and/or testimony. 

18  Both Shilling’s and Huber’s contracts each have a total value of $50,000, which is the 

maximum contract size that the governor’s office can give out without going through a competitive 

procurement process. 

19  Exhibit E. 
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The way these contracts were awarded (without any competitive bids), and the manner in 

which they are being performed (contemporaneous with, and in support of, issues related to 

Dunleavy’s re-election campaign), are almost certainly a violation of Alaska’s Executive Ethics 

Act (“Ethics Act”).  Specifically, AS 39.52.120(b)(6) provides that a “public official may not … 

use or authorize the use of state funds, facilities, equipment, services, or another government asset 

or resource for partisan political purposes[.]” 

A cursory review of the election year behavior of past governors indicates that this behavior 

is unprecedented in Alaska.  Because APOC does not enforce the Ethics Act, a separate complaint 

will be lodged with the Alaska Personnel Board, but due to the timing of these violations, only 

APOC is able to take timely action.20  However, as discussed below, the facts of these contracts 

— and the close, integrated working relationship that the parties are engaged in — is important 

background for this Complaint because it is evidence of the illegal coordination which APOC’s 

statutes (and governing federal law) do prohibit.21  These contractors report directly to the Office 

of the Governor and his Chief of Staff, meaning it is undeniable that there is direct, regular, and 

sustained contact between Huber/SS, Shilling, Dunleavy, Gallagher, and members of his official 

staff who volunteer for the campaign.  

 
20  Significantly, AS 39.52.310(j) & (k) provide that, during the “campaign period,” a 

candidate for governor or lieutenant governor who is the subject of an Ethics Act complaint can 

block investigation of the complaint until after the conclusion of the election.  It is not anticipated 

that Dunleavy will allow an investigation into whether his actions violate the Ethics Act to 

commence until after the election. 

21  There are several staffers still working in the governor’s office who perform “volunteer” 

work for Dunleavy’s campaign, however they reportedly do this work after hours or submit leave 

slips to perform the work.  On the good faith assumption that this is indeed the case, they are not 

subject to any allegations of illegal activity at this time, apart from passively participating in the 

illegal coordination with Huber/SS. 
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B. The RGA Contributed $3 Million Nearly Two Years Before An 
Election In Order To Evade The Disclosure Of Its Donors, Which Is 
Now Required Under Alaska Law. 

The RGA contributed $3 million to ASA on February 25, 2021, just three days before new 

campaign finance provisions enacted by the passage of Ballot Measure 2 became effective.22 

Relevant here is the ban on “Dark Money” in Alaska’s elections.23  The term “Dark Money” refers 

to funds used in elections for which the actual donor is not revealed to the public.  Rather, Dark 

Money is money that is effectively laundered through an intermediary entity to conceal its true 

source.  Because the RGA donated its $3 million before the February 28, 2021 effective date, the 

source of those funds has not been revealed.  It is obvious (and uncontested) that the timing of the 

RGA’s donation was intended to evade APOC’s application of the new disclosure rules. 

When this donation of anonymous funds became public knowledge, Dunleavy 

acknowledged it was for his benefit and issued a statement through the individual who serves as 

both the governor’s official and campaign spokesman that he “[o]bviously . . . appreciates the 

support of the RGA.”24   

C. Huber/SS — The Sole Contractor Working For ASA — Dunleavy, 
DFG, And State Employees Working For DFG, Have Unlawfully 
Coordinated Their Campaign Activities.  

ASA was formed and funded for the purpose of reelecting Governor Dunleavy.25  On 

May 6, 2022, ASA reported that it had retained Huber/SS to consult for and manage its 

independent expenditure activities in support of Dunleavy from April 29, 2022 through the election 

 
22  https://www.dermotcole.com/reportingfromalaska/2022/2/15/republican-governors-

association-avoided-revealing-3-million-donation-to-back-dunleavy. 

23  See AS 15.13.074(b); AS 15.13.400(17), (18). 

24  https://www.adn.com/politics/2022/02/17/national-republican-group-sidesteps-new-

disclosure-law-with-3-million-donation-in-alaska-governors-race/. 

25  https://aws.state.ak.us/ApocReports/Common/View.aspx?ID=5471&ViewType=IE. 
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for $80,500.26  Specifically, Huber’s assigned task is to support Dunleavy in the 2022 elections by 

providing “Consulting/Political Support Services.”27 Even after executing his ASA contract, 

Huber continued to act as a deputy campaign treasurer for Michael Dunleavy’s 2022 campaign for 

governor.28  He was a campaign deputy treasurer until Tuesday, May 31 at 2 pm.29  To be clear:  

Huber was simultaneously an officer of DFG (Dunleavy’s official campaign committee) and 

the sole consultant running ASA (the IE organization formed for the sole purpose of re-

electing Dunleavy).  And, importantly, Huber was not removed as an officer of DFG until it was 

commented on publicly and then covered by the media.30  (Interestingly, Shilling remains a Deputy 

Treasurer while continuing to be the beneficiary of his no-bid contract reporting directly to the 

governor and his Chief of Staff.)31 

In addition to his contemporaneous service as an officer of both DFG and ASA, Huber’s 

own no-bid contract with Governor Dunleavy reportedly remains in place, meaning he’s making 

a grand total of over $130,000 for approximately six months of work.32  But, more importantly, he 

has direct and regular contact with Dunleavy, Gallagher, and the rest of the senior staff while still 

 
26  https://aws.state.ak.us/ApocReports/Common/View.aspx?ID=5471&ViewType=IE. 

27  Id.  

28  https://www.adn.com/politics/2022/05/31/gov-dunleavys-office-signs-contract-with-

former-aide-whos-also-being-paid-to-help-with-his-re-election/. 

29  https://aws.state.ak.us/ApocReports/Common/View.aspx?ID=6484&ViewType=CR. 

30  See https://www.adn.com/politics/2022/05/31/gov-dunleavys-office-signs-contract-with-

former-aide-whos-also-being-paid-to-help-with-his-re-election/;  

https://twitter.com/scooterkendall/status/1531734450773426176?s=20&t=9018KneikQJAbL9gg

hmeqw. 

31  https://aws.state.ak.us/ApocReports/Common/View.aspx?ID=6484&ViewType=CR. 

32  It is unknown if Huber/SS has additional contracts, but APOC Staff could subpoena all 

current contracts and agreements as part of its investigation. 
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running ASA.  This is the same senior staff who (as discussed above) work directly with DFG 

(Dunleavy’s official campaign) in lead capacities during their “free” time.   

Taken as a whole, these facts add up to the clearest case of unlawful coordination 

between a campaign and an IE organization that APOC has ever been presented with.  Not 

only has ASA coordinated with Governor Dunleavy and DFG through Huber/SS, it has also 

unintentionally documented these improper relationships in official reports and contracts, both 

through Huber’s ongoing contracts with both sides (Dunleavy and the IE organization benefiting 

Governor Dunleavy), as well as his simultaneous service as a contractor for ASA and a Deputy 

Treasurer of DFG. 

IV. LEGAL BACKGROUND 

A. Unlimited Independent Expenditures Are Allowed By Law, But Only 
If There Is No Coordination, Directly Or Indirectly, With A 
Candidate Or A Candidate’s Campaign. 

Over a decade ago, the cases Citizens United33 and SpeechNow.org v. FEC34 created a 

campaign finance regime in which unlimited funds could be raised and spent to support or oppose 

candidates for office, by finding a First Amendment right to such activities.  These activities are 

typically called “independent expenditures” or “IEs,” and the groups that perform them are 

generally known as “SuperPACs.”   However, the U.S. Supreme Court and the Federal Election 

Commission (“FEC”) are clear that, for such activities to be lawful, they cannot be coordinated, 

 
33  558 U.S. 310 (2010). 

34  599 F.3d 686 (D.C. Cir. 2010); see also FEC Advisory Op. 2010-11 (Commonsense Ten) 

at 2-3. 
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directly or indirectly, with the supported candidate.35  Any such coordination renders current and 

future actions of the SuperPAC unlawful.36 

Because of these federal cases, Alaska is required to permit the same activities — i.e., 

independent expenditures — under the First Amendment.  Under Alaska law any entity that makes 

such “independent expenditure[s]”37 “to influence the outcome of an election” must file public 

reports of its activities.   

It is undisputed that ASA is registered as such an entity.  However, like their federal 

counterparts, the actions of an IE group like ASA must be “made without the direct or indirect 

consultation or cooperation with, or at the suggestion or the request of, or with the prior consent 

of, a candidate, a candidate’s campaign treasurer or deputy campaign treasurer, or another person 

acting as a principal or agent of the candidate[.]”38  

In this case the record is clear that the required separation does not exist.  The Respondents 

have all directly and indirectly communicated — and continue to communicate — about Governor 

Dunleavy’s campaign and matters related to his campaign while directly or indirectly participating 

in the management of ASA, the IE entity supporting Dunleavy’s re-election.  In fact, Huber/SS 

simultaneously served as a Deputy Treasurer of DGF while under contract to ASA and while 

working directly for Dunleavy and his Chief of Staff.  It is tough to imagine how one could avoid 

coordinating with oneself. 

 
35  See AS 15.13.400(11); see also APOC v. Patrick, 494 P.3d 53, 54 (Alaska 2021) 

(explaining how this prohibition is in place to, in part, prevent “quid pro quo corruption” (emphasis 

in original) (quoting Citizens United, 558 U.S. at 359, 365)). 

36  See, e.g., 11 C.F.R. 109.21(c)(4)(ii) & (c)(5)(i). 

37  See AS 15.13.400(11). 

38  Id. (emphasis added); see also AS 15.13.072(a)(1). 
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V. ARGUMENT 

A. The RGA, Huber/SS, A Stronger Alaska, Governor Dunleavy, And 
DFG Have Engaged In Unprecedented Improper Coordination. 

When IE groups engage in activities, there are often rumors and vague allegations of 

coordination.  But, typically, those involved are savvy enough to avoid improper contacts between 

official campaigns and independent efforts.  In this case, APOC is presented with an unprecedented 

situation where public records and exhibits demonstrate past and present coordination and contacts 

between the RGA, Huber/SS, ASA, Dunleavy, Gallagher, and DFG. 

 As demonstrated by the facts above, the Respondents have blurred and overstepped all 

lines of separation that must exist between an official campaign and a group performing 

independent expenditures.  It is uncontested that: 

• Huber/SS served as a Deputy Treasurer of DFG while simultaneously being the contractor 

running ASA. 

 

o Given the prohibition on a “deputy treasurer” consulting “directly or indirectly” 

with an IE organization, a deputy treasurer of an official campaign 
simultaneously managing an IE supporting the same candidate is the clearest 
possible example of illegal coordination. 

 

o That DFG removed Huber as a deputy treasurer only after it was publicly exposed 

cannot sanitize the period of coordination.  If anything, it is an admission of guilt. 

 

• While running ASA, Huber/SS has an ongoing no-bid contract with the Office of the 

Governor that: 

 

o Runs essentially the length of the campaign; 

 

o Touches on a campaign-related issue (advising on legal challenges on access to 

lands); 

 

o Has essentially no deliverables; 

 

o Would clearly be better performed by any one of many state employees with both 

expertise in federal lands law and a law degree; and 

 

o Reports directly to the governor and COS Gallagher. 
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• The RGA has used ASA as its alter-ego in Alaska — given it is the sole donor and its 

officers control the entity — meaning: 

 

o Any coordination undertaken by ASA through Huber should be imputed to have 

tainted their efforts in Alaska since Huber was acting solely in their employ. 

 

• Huber/SS and Shilling both have ongoing contracts which require them to report directly 

to the Governor and his COS on politically-charged issues:  

 

o Both the manager of Dunleavy’s official campaign (DFG) and the manager of the 

IE organization meant to benefit Dunleavy (ASA) have direct and regular contact 

with Dunleavy, his COS Gallagher, state employees who “volunteer” for the 

campaign on their own time, and likely each other. 

 

Such a level of cross-contamination is de facto evidence of coordination between the RGA, 

Huber/SS, ASA, Dunleavy, DFG, and state employees who work on the campaign as “volunteers” 

outside of their official duties.  Evidence of past coordination is clearly established, and because 

the contracts cited are ongoing, there is current coordination occurring, and — absent intervention 

— there will be future coordination as well. 

B. Because Of The Blatant And Illegal Coordination Among 
Respondents, APOC Must Either Dissolve ASA, Or, At A Minimum, 
Force It To Cease Making Any Expenditures During The 2022 
Election Cycle. 

Prohibited coordination, both past and present, has been established between the 

Respondents in this case.  Accordingly, APOC must turn to the issue of the appropriate remedy.   

It does not appear that APOC has been faced with a case like this before. This is not a run-

of-the-mill reporting violation for which a daily fine and subsequent disclosure may be appropriate 

and curative.  Rather, this Complaint involves a rampant and ongoing disregard for the laws 

prohibiting coordination between candidates’ campaign and an IE organization.  Accordingly, the 

only appropriate remedy is injunctive relief to cease the ongoing unlawful coordination.39 

 
39  See AS 15.13.380(d)(1). 
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Federal precedent makes clear that the Respondents’ coordination is unlawful.  Any 

communication that is coordinated is considered an in-kind contribution from the IE organization 

to the candidate.40  However, an IE organization is prohibited from making in-kind contributions 

because such groups can accumulate contributions from sources that are prohibited from directly 

contributing to candidates.41 

As APOC considers remedies, it’s important to note that the taint of coordination cannot 

be cured by ASA simply terminating Huber/SS’s ongoing employment contract.  The FEC has 

specifically addressed this issue for a Committee that proposed terminating an employee who 

engaged in illegal coordination “immediately upon learning of the violation.”42  In that situation 

the FEC concluded that such immediate termination of an employee “would not render subsequent 

communications independent” if that employee had access to material information regarding 

communications.43 

 Because Huber/SS is the sole contractor engaged in advising and managing ASA, it cannot 

seriously be argued that his participation in communications and strategy was not material.  

Accordingly, APOC must now turn to what curative actions are appropriate to prevent unlawfully 

coordinated communications from occurring. 

 APOC has several options: 

 
40  11 C.F.R. 109.21(a)&(b)(1). 

41  FEC Advisory Op. 2016-21 (Great America PAC) at 3-4; see also FEC Advisory Op. 2010-

11 (Commonsense Ten) at 3 (stating that IE organizations can receive unlimited funds from 

corporations and labor organizations that candidates cannot). 

42  In this instance, ASA and Dunleavy did not even attempt to promptly cure the coordination.  

Huber/SS remains under contract with both ASA and the governor’s office to this day. 

43  FEC Advisory Op. 2016-21 (Great America PAC). 
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• APOC could enjoin ASA’s campaign activities for the remainder of the election cycle 

(making ASA ineligible to participate in supporting Dunleavy’s election);44 

 

• APOC could order that ASA be dissolved and all assets returned to the donor entity: the 

RGA.  Presumably, if the RGA brought in entirely new personnel who were not tainted by 

Huber/SS’s coordination they could “re-donate” the funds and form a new IE organization 

to participate in the 2022 campaign in support of Dunleavy;45 or 

 

• APOC, consistent with federal law, could allow for the taint of illegal coordination to 

dissipate following an appropriate “cooling off” period.  If Governor Dunleavy and DFG 

cut off the contracts and all material contact with Huber/SS, then — 120 days after the last 

contact — Huber/SS and ASA could be free to undertake communications again.46   
 

Any or all of these remedies are appropriate and necessary.  What APOC cannot allow is 

for ASA and Huber/SS to continue making a mockery of APOC’s statutes and federal law by 

brazenly continuing to unlawfully coordinate their activities with Dunleavy and his official 

campaign.  At a minimum, the Commission must order ASA to cease all activities until APOC 

Staff has had time to complete a thorough investigation.47 

VI. CONCLUSION 

 APOC has never been presented with such a blatant case of illegal coordination between a 

candidate, a candidate’s campaign, and an IE supporting the same candidate.  This case does not 

present a close call.   

 
44  See AS 15.13.380(d)(1) (authorizing APOC to “enter an emergency order requiring the 

violation to be ceased” if “the respondent has engaged in or is about to engage in an act or practice 

that constitutes or will constitute a violation of this chapter or a regulation adopted under this 

chapter”). 

45  Of course, in doing so the RGA would have to comply with the now-effective “Dark 

Money” disclosures, compelling RGA to reveal the “true sources” of its funding. 

46  See 11 C.F.R. 109.21(c)(4)(ii) & (c)(5)(i) (providing a safe harbor for former contractors 

and employees of a candidate to participate in independent expenditure activities following a 120-

day cooling off period). 

47  See AS 15.13.380(d)(1). 





(QWLW\�1DPH� �6WUDWHJLF�6\QHUJLHV�//&

(QWLW\�1XPEHU� ���������

+RPH�&RXQWU\� �81,7('�67$7(6

+RPH�6WDWH�3URY�� �$/$6.$

3K\VLFDO�$GGUHVV� �����:���WK�$YH��6XLWH������$1&+25$*(�
$.������

0DLOLQJ�$GGUHVV� �����:���WK�$YH��6XLWH������$1&+25$*(�
$.������

5HJLVWHUHG�$JHQW�LQIRUPDWLRQ�FDQQRW�EH�FKDQJHG�RQ�WKLV�IRUP��3HU
$ODVND�6WDWXWHV��WR�XSGDWH�RU�FKDQJH�WKH�5HJLVWHUHG�$JHQW
LQIRUPDWLRQ�WKLV�HQWLW\�PXVW�VXEPLW�WKH�6WDWHPHQW�RI�&KDQJH�IRUP
IRU�WKLV�HQWLW\�W\SH�DORQJ�ZLWK�LWV�ILOLQJ�IHH�

1DPH� �%UHWW�+XEHU

3K\VLFDO�$GGUHVV� ������6+(3+(5',$�'5,9��$1&+25$*(�
$.�����������

0DLOLQJ�$GGUHVV� ������6+(3+(5',$�'5,9��$1&+25$*(�
$.�����������

'RPHVWLF�/LPLWHG�/LDELOLW\�&RPSDQ\

,QLWLDO�%LHQQLDO�5HSRUW

2IILFLDOV��7KH�IROORZLQJ�LV�D�FRPSOHWH�OLVW�RI�RIILFLDOV�ZKR�ZLOO�EH�RQ�UHFRUG�DV�D�UHVXOW�RI�WKLV�ILOLQJ�

3URYLGH�DOO�RIILFLDOV�DQG�UHTXLUHG�LQIRUPDWLRQ��8VH�RQO\�WKH�WLWOHV�SURYLGHG�
0DQGDWRU\�0HPEHUV��WKLV�HQWLW\�PXVW�KDYH�DW�OHDVW�RQH�����0HPEHU��$�0HPEHU�PXVW�RZQ�D����,Q�DGGLWLRQ��WKLV�HQWLW\�PXVW�SURYLGH
DOO�0HPEHUV�ZKR�RZQ����RU�PRUH�RI�WKH�HQWLW\��$�0HPEHU�PD\�EH�DQ�LQGLYLGXDO�RU�DQRWKHU�HQWLW\�
0DQDJHU��,I�WKH�HQWLW\�LV�PDQDJHU�PDQDJHG��SHU�LWV�DUWLFOHV�RU�DPHQGPHQW��WKHQ�WKHUH�PXVW�EH�DW�OHDVW�����0DQDJHU�SURYLGHG��$
0DQDJHU�PD\�EH�D�0HPEHU�LI�WKH�0DQDJHU�DOVR�RZQV�D���RI�WKH�HQWLW\�

)XOO�/HJDO�1DPH &RPSOHWH�0DLOLQJ�$GGUHVV ��2ZQHG

%UHWW�+XEHU��65� ����:���WK�$YH��6WH������$QFKRUDJH���$.������� ���� �;�

,I�QHFHVVDU\��DWWDFK�D�OLVW�RI�DGGLWLRQDO�RIILFHUV�RQ�D�VHSDUDWH�����;����VKHHW�RI�SDSHU�

1$,&6�&RGH� ����������$'0,1,675$7,9(�0$1$*(0(17�$1'�*(1(5$/�0$1$*(0(17
&2168/7,1*�6(59,&(6

1HZ�1$,&6�&RGH��RSWLRQDO�� �
�

7KLV�IRUP�LV�IRU�XVH�E\�WKH�QDPHG�HQWLW\�RQO\��2QO\�SHUVRQV�ZKR�DUH�DXWKRUL]HG�E\�WKH�DERYH�2IILFLDO�V��RI�WKH�QDPHG�HQWLW\�PD\�PDNH
FKDQJHV�WR�LW��,I�\RX�SURFHHG�WR�PDNH�FKDQJHV�WR�WKLV�IRUP�RU�DQ\�LQIRUPDWLRQ�RQ�LW��\RX�ZLOO�EH�FHUWLI\LQJ�XQGHU�SHQDOW\�RI�SHUMXU\�WKDW�\RX
DUH�DXWKRUL]HG�WR�PDNH�WKRVH�FKDQJHV��DQG�WKDW�HYHU\WKLQJ�RQ�WKH�IRUP�LV�WUXH�DQG�FRUUHFW��,Q�DGGLWLRQ��SHUVRQV�ZKR�ILOH�GRFXPHQWV�ZLWK
WKH�FRPPLVVLRQHU�WKDW�DUH�NQRZQ�WR�WKH�SHUVRQ�WR�EH�IDOVH�LQ�PDWHULDO�UHVSHFWV�DUH�JXLOW\�RI�D�FODVV�$�PLVGHPHDQRU��&RQWLQXDWLRQ�PHDQV
\RX�KDYH�UHDG�WKLV�DQG�XQGHUVWDQG�LW�

1DPH� �%UHWW�:��+XEHU�6W

'HSDUWPHQW�RI�&RPPHUFH��&RPPXQLW\��DQG�(FRQRPLF�'HYHORSPHQW�
'LYLVLRQ�RI�&RUSRUDWLRQV��%XVLQHVV��DQG�3URIHVVLRQDO�/LFHQVLQJ�
32�%R[���������-XQHDX��$.������������
�����������������(PDLO��FRUSRUDWLRQV#DODVND�JRY�
:HEVLWH��FRUSRUDWLRQV�DODVND�JRY

�&25
)25�',9,6,21�86(�21/<

0
HP

EH
U

(QWLW\������������ 3DJH���RI��

AK Entity #: 10156471
Date Filed: 04/29/2022

State of Alaska, DCCED

Exhibit A 
Page 1 of 1



Exhibit B 
Page 1 of 3



Exhibit B 
Page 2 of 3



Exhibit B 
Page 3 of 3



Exhibit C 
Page 1 of 6



Exhibit C 
Page 2 of 6



Exhibit C 
Page 3 of 6



Exhibit C 
Page 4 of 6



Exhibit C 
Page 5 of 6



Exhibit C 
Page 6 of 6



Exhibit D 
Page 1 of 6



Exhibit D 
Page 2 of 6



Exhibit D 
Page 3 of 6



Exhibit D 
Page 4 of 6



Exhibit D 
Page 5 of 6



Exhibit D 
Page 6 of 6



Exhibit E 
Page 1 of 5



Exhibit E 
Page 2 of 5



Exhibit E 
Page 3 of 5



Exhibit E 
Page 4 of 5



Exhibit E 
Page 5 of 5


